
Confidentiality and storage of data 
 
By completing this training task, you consent to the research team collecting and 
using personal information about you for the research project. As part of the online 
survey you are required to provide some health related information and your phone 
number. You are NOT required to give any other information that could identify you 
(e.g., date of birth, name, etc). Any information obtained in connection with this 
research project will remain confidential. Files containing information we collect 
about you will be coded with your allocated participant number (code), and will not 
be labelled with your name, phone number or any other identifying details. A record 
of which participant codes correspond to the mobile phone numbers provided by 
participants will be stored separately in a password protected computer file that can 
be accessed only by the research team. Your task performance will be stored on a 
server owned by ANT productions alongside your participant number only. This data 
will be extracted and provided to the research team and stored in a password 
protected computer file labelled only with your participant number. Only the 
researchers involved in the project will have access to any data provided by you 
during the research project. Your information will only be used for the purpose of this 
research project and it will not be disclosed without your permission, except as 
required by law. 
 
It is anticipated that the results of this research project will be published and/or 
presented in a variety of forums including at conferences, academic journals and in a 
PhD thesis. In any publication and/or presentation, only summary information about 
the groups of participants (e.g., average scores, ranges of scores) will be presented. 
We will not present data about individual participants that could identify them. 7 
years after completion of the project, electronic data will be destroyed by deletion of 
files, in compliance with the Monash Human Research Ethics Committee 
requirements.  
 


